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(dd) State means any State of the 
United States and the District of Co-
lumbia, the Commonwealth of Puerto 
Rico, the Virgin Islands, Guam, the 
Canal Zone, American Samoa, the 
Northern Mariana Islands, and any 
other territory or possession of the 
United States. 

(ee) Technically qualified individual 
means a person or persons (1) who, be-
cause of education, training, or experi-
ence, or a combination of these factors, 
is capable of understanding the health 
and environmental risks associated 
with the chemical substance which is 
used under his or her supervision, (2) 
who is responsible for enforcing appro-
priate methods of conducting scientific 
experimentation, analysis, or chemical 
research to minimize such risks, and 
(3) who is responsible for the safety as-
sessments and clearances related to the 
procurement, storage, use, and disposal 
of the chemical substance as may be 
appropriate or required within the 
scope of conducting a research and de-
velopment activity. 

(ff) Test data means data from a for-
mal or informal test or experiment, in-
cluding information concerning the ob-
jectives, experimental methods and 
materials, protocols, results, data anal-
yses, recorded observations, moni-
toring data, measurements, and con-
clusions from a test or experiment. 

(gg) Test marketing means the dis-
tribution in commerce of no more than 
a predetermined amount of a chemical 
substance, mixture, or article con-
taining that chemical substance or 
mixture, by a manufacturer or proc-
essor, to no more than a defined num-
ber of potential customers to explore 
market capability in a competitive sit-
uation during a predetermined testing 
period prior to the broader distribution 
of that chemical substance, mixture, or 
article in commerce. 

(hh) United States, when used in the 
geographic sense, means all of the 
States. 

(ii) Central Data Exchange or CDX 
means EPA’s centralized electronic 
document receiving system, or its suc-
cessors. 

(jj) e-PMN software means electronic- 
PMN software created by EPA for use 
in preparing and submitting 
Premanufacture Notices (PMNs) and 

other TSCA section 5 notices and sup-
port documents electronically to the 
Agency. 

(kk) Optical disc means compact disc 
(CD) or digital video disc (DVD). 

(ll) Support documents means mate-
rials and information submitted to 
EPA in support of a TSCA section 5 no-
tice, including but not limited to, cor-
respondence, amendments, and test 
data. The term ‘‘support documents’’ 
does not include orders under TSCA 
section 5(e) (either consent orders or 
orders imposed pursuant to TSCA sec-
tion 5(e)(2)(B)). 

[48 FR 21742, May 13, 1983, as amended at 51 
FR 15101, Apr. 22, 1986; 75 FR 784, Jan. 6, 2010] 

Subpart B—Applicability 
§ 720.22 Persons who must report. 

(a)(1) Any person who intends to 
manufacture a new chemical substance 
in the United States for commercial 
purposes must submit a notice unless 
the substance is excluded under § 720.30. 

(2) If a person contracts with a manu-
facturer to manufacture or produce a 
new chemical substance, and (i) the 
manufacturer manufactures or pro-
duces the substance exclusively for 
that person, and (ii) that person speci-
fies the identity of the substance, and 
controls the total amount produced 
and the basic technology for the plant 
process, that person must submit the 
notice. If it is unclear who must report, 
EPA should be contacted to determine 
who must submit the notice. 

(3) Only manufacturers that are in-
corporated, licensed, or doing business 
in the United States may submit a no-
tice. 

(b)(1) Any person who intends to im-
port a new chemical substance into the 
United States for commercial purposes 
must submit a notice, unless the sub-
stance is excluded under § 720.30 or un-
less the substance is imported as part 
of an article. 

(2) When several persons are involved 
in an import transaction, the notice 
must be submitted by the principal im-
porter. If no one person fits the prin-
cipal importer definition in a par-
ticular transaction, the importer 
should contact EPA to determine who 
must submit the notice for that trans-
action. 
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